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1.Where Are 1z1-106 Exam Dumps From, Photoexperienceacademy is the best source where
you can get exceptional 1z1-106 Exam Dumps, Our aims are to help all 1z1-106 candidates to
pass the 1z1-106 exam and get the Oracle certification successfully.

NEW QUESTION: 1Refer to the exhibit.Switch A, B, and C are trunked together and have been
properly configured for VTP. Switch B has all VLANs, but Switch C is not receiving traffic from
certain VLANs. What would cause this issue?A. The trunk between Switch A and Switch B is
misconfigured.B. VTP pruning is configured globally on all switches and it removed VLANs from
the trunk interface that is connected to Switch C.C. The VTP revision number of Switch B is
higher than that of Switch A.D. A VTP authentication mismatch occurred between Switch A and
Switch B.Answer: BExplanation:Explanation/Reference:Explanation:VTP pruning increases
network available bandwidth by restricting flooded traffic to those trunk links that the traffic
must use to reach the destination devices. Without VTP pruning, a switch floods broadcast,
multicast, and unknown unicast traffic across all trunk links within a VTP domain even though
receiving switches might discard them. VTP pruning is disabled by default. VTP pruning blocks
unneeded flooded traffic to VLANs on trunk ports that are included in the pruning-eligible list.
The best explanation for why switch C is not seeing traffic from only some of the VLANs, is that
VTP pruning has been configured.

NEW QUESTION: 2Welche Abrechnungsclustertabelle wird als Datenquelle zum Befüllen eines
Abrechnungsinfotyps verwendet?Bitte wählen Sie die richtige Antwort.A. Tabelle Arbeitsplatz /
Grundgehalt (WPBP)B. Kostenverteilungstabelle (CO)C. Tabelle mit Zahlungsinformationen
(BT)D. Ergebnistabelle (RT)Answer: D

NEW QUESTION: 3How does AWS charge for AWS Lambda?A. Users choose a 1-, 3- or 5-year
upfront payment term.B. Users pay based on the number of requests and consumed compute
resources.C. Users bid on the maximum price they are willing to pay per hour.D. Users pay for
the required permanent storage on a file system or in a database.Answer: BExplanation:AWS
Lambda is charging its users by the number of requests for their functions and by the duration,
which is the time the code needs to execute. When code starts running in response to an event,
AWS Lambda counts a request. It will charge the total number of requests across all of the
functions used. Duration is calculated by the time when your code started executing until it
returns or until it is terminated, rounded up near to 100ms. The AWS Lambda pricing depends
on the amount of memory that the user used to allocate to the function.

NEW QUESTION: 4A. Feste Lieferanten in der Quellenliste von Lieferant A zu Lieferant BB.
Materialtyp von ROH (Rohstoff) zu FERT (Fertigprodukt)C. Materialgruppe im Materialstamm
von Warengruppe 1 bis Materialgruppe 2D. Basismengeneinheit im Materialstamm von EA
(jeweils), KG (Kilogramm)Answer: A,C
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