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NEW QUESTION: 1You are developing an application that includes a method named
SendMessage.You need to ensure that the SendMessage() method is called with the required
parameters.Which two code segments can you use to achieve this goal? (Each correct answer
presents a complete solution. Choose two.)A. Option AB. Option DC. Option CD. Option B
Answer: B,CExplanation:Explanation/Reference:Explanation:D: ExpandoObjectRepresents an
object whose members can be dynamically added and removed at run time.The
ExpandoObject class enables you to add and delete members of its instances at run time and
alsoto set and get values of these members. This class supports dynamic binding, which
enables you to use standard syntax like sampleObject.sampleMember instead of more complex
syntax like sampleObject.GetAttribute("sampleMember").You can pass instances of the
ExpandoObject class as parameters. Note that these instances aretreated as dynamic objects in
C# and late-bound objects in Visual Basic. This means that you do not have IntelliSense for
object members and you do not receive compiler errors when you call non- existent members.
If you call a member that does not exist, an exception occurs.Note:Visual C# 2010 introduces a
new type, dynamic. The type is a static type, but an object of type dynamic bypasses static type
checking. In most cases, it functions like it has type object. At compile time, an element that is
typed as dynamic is assumed to support any operation. Therefore, you do not have to be
concerned about whether the object gets its value from a COM API, from a dynamic language
such as IronPython, from the HTML Document Object Model (DOM), from reflection, or from
somewhere else in the program. However, if the code is not valid, errors are caught at run time.

NEW QUESTION: 2Jennifer McHanry is CEO of ACME. She recently bought her own personal
iPad. She wants use her iPad to access the internal Finance Web server. Because the iPad is not
a member of the Active Directory domain, she cannot identify seamlessly with AD Query.
However, she can enter her AD credentials in the Captive Portal and then get the same access
as on her office computer. Her access to resources is based on rules in the R77 Firewall Rule
Base.To make this scenario work, the IT administrator must:1) Enable Identity Awareness on a
gateway and select Captive Portal as one of the Identity Sources.2) In the Portal Settings
window in the User Access section, make sure that Name and password login is selected.3)
Create a new rule in the Firewall Rule Base to let Jennifer McHanry access network
destinations. Select accept as the Action.4) Install policy.Ms McHanry tries to access the
resource but is unable. What should she do?A. Have the security administrator reboot the
firewall.B. Install the Identity Awareness agent on her iPad.C. Have the security administrator
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select Any for the Machines tab in the appropriate Access Role.D. Have the security
administrator select the Action field of the Firewall Rule "Redirect HTTP connections to an
authentication (captive) portal".Answer: D

NEW QUESTION: 3Scenario:A. Option AB. Option DC. Option BD. Option CAnswer: A
Explanation:A show running-config command on R3 and R4 shows that R4 is incorrectly
configured for area 2:
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