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NEW QUESTION: 1A company has external vendors that must deliver files to the company.
These vendors have cross-account that gives them permission to upload objects to one of the
company's S3 buckets.What combination of steps must the vendor follow to successfully
deliver a file to the company? Select 2 answers from the options given below Please select:A.
Upload the file to the company's S3 bucketB. Encrypt the object with a KMS key controlled by
the company.C. Add a bucket policy to the bucket that grants the bucket owner full
permissions to the objectD. Attach an IAM role to the bucket that grants the bucket owner full
permissions to the objectE. Add a grant to the objects ACL giving full permissions to bucket
owner.Answer: A,EExplanation:This scenario is given in the AWS DocumentationA bucket
owner can enable other AWS accounts to upload objects. These objects are owned by the
accounts that created them. The bucket owner does not own objects that were not created by
the bucket owner. Therefore, for the bucket owner to grant access to these objects, the object
owner must first grant permission to the bucket owner using an object ACL. The bucket owner
can then delegate those permissions via a bucket policy. In this example, the bucket owner
delegates permission to users in its own account.Option A and D are invalid because bucket
ACL's are used to give grants to bucket Option C is not required since encryption is not part of
the requirement For more information on this scenario please see the below Link:
https://docs.aws.amazon.com/AmazonS3/latest/dev/example-walkthroushs-manaeing-access
-example3.htmll The correct answers are: Add a grant to the objects ACL giving full permissions
to bucket owner., Upload the file to the company's S3 bucket Submit your Feedback/Queries to
our Experts

NEW QUESTION: 2Which of the following statements are true regarding proxy authorization?
(Choose 2)A. set proxy is only permitted at one levelB. set proxy can be executed within a
transactionC. set proxy within a procedure retains the identity of the proxy when you exitD.
proxy authorization is granted by the System AdministratorE. set proxy can be executed in a
database with a guest userAnswer: A,E

NEW QUESTION: 3An organization wants to offer an on-screen survey immediately after an
online (WBT) course is completed. How can they achieve this?A. Create or import the course
and map an assessment instance to that course with the post-test option selected.B. Add
survey questions inside a LearnCenter course.C. Use the built in SurveyMonkey integration to
push the survey after the course has been completed.D. Email the assessment instance when

http://www.photoexperienceacademy.com/ticket/post-Reliable-Exam--Pass4sure-384840/HPE0-S60-exam/


the course is completed.Answer: C

NEW QUESTION: 4HOTSPOTYou have a file server named Server1 that runs Windows Server
2012. Server1 contains a folder named Folder1.A user named User1 is a member of Group1 and
Group2. A user named User2 is amember of Group2 and Group3.You need to identify which
actions the users can perform when they access the files inShare1.What should you identify?To
answer, select the appropriate actions for each user in the answer area.Answer: Explanation:
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