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NEW QUESTION: 1Which option can be used to provide a nonproprietary method of load
balancing and redundancy betweenthe access and aggregation layers in the data center?A.
PAgPB. LACPC. host vPCD. vPCAnswer: BExplanation:Explanation/Reference:Explanation:

NEW QUESTION: 2Your network contains an Active Directory domain named contoso.com.
Client computers run either Windows 7 or Windows 8.You plan to implement several Group
Policy settings that will apply only to laptopcomputers.You need to recommend a Group Policy
strategy for the planned deployment.What should you include in the recommendation?More
than one answer choice may achieve the goal. Select the BEST answer.A. WMI filteringB. Block
inheritanceC. Security filteringD. Loopback processingAnswer: AExplanation:Group Policy WMI
Filter - Laptop or Desktop Hardware A method to detect hardware as laptop only is to look for
the presence of a battery based on the BatteryStatus property of the Win32_Battery class. By
using the Win32_Battery class, we can search to see if there is a battery present. If the battery
status is not equal to zero (BatteryStatus <> 0 ) then you know that it is a laptop.Reference:
Group Policy WMI Filter - Laptop or Desktop Hardware
http://discoposse.com/2012/04/05/group-policy-wmi-filter-laptop-or-desktop-hardware/

NEW QUESTION: 3Sie verwalten Kassenterminals, auf denen Windows 7 ausgeführt wird.Sie
müssen die Terminals auf Windows 10 aktualisieren. Terminals dürfen mindestens fünf Jahre
lang nicht erneut aktualisiert werden. Sie haben folgende Anforderungen:Führen Sie eine
konsistente Planung von Upgrades und Updates auf allen Geräten durch.Kosten minimieren.
Sie müssen sich auf die Upgrades vorbereiten.Was solltest du verwenden? Um zu antworten,
wählen Sie die entsprechenden Optionen im Antwortbereich aus.HINWEIS: Jede richtige
Auswahl ist einen Punkt wert.Answer: Explanation:ExplanationReferences:
https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/windows/deployment/update/waas-overview#long-term-se
rvicing-channel
https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/windows/deployment/update/waas-overview#servicing-too
ls
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